

Reactivate Claim + Attach Local Document

Refresh Save Close Help Action

Properties | Audit Activities | Activities | Overclaims | Documents | History/Comments | Tasks | Related Claims

Hours Subtotal: [REDACTED] Max Compensation: \$2,000.00

Service Date	Expense Type	Expense Description	Audit Quantity	Audit Unit Cost	Audit Total Cost
<b>Attorney In Court</b>					<b>Subtotal: [REDACTED]</b>
10/8/2021	In Court	Initial Hearing	1	50	50
1/4/2022	In Court	Perm Plan & Periodic Rev	1.8	50	90
1/10/2022	In Court	continuance (.6)	0.6	50	30
2/23/2022	In Court	agreed order to continue (.1)	0.1	50	5
3/22/2022	In Court	children returned to mother; continuance on [REDACTED]	2.5	50	125
7/7/2022	In Court	Motion hearing - matter to be reset; change of counsel; (1.3)	1.3	50	65
4/24/2023	In Court	Continuance granted due to pending criminal charges (.5)	0.5	50	25
7/31/2023	In Court	Adjudication	0.4	50	20
<b>Attorney Out of Court</b>					<b>Subtotal: [REDACTED]</b>
10/6/2021	Out of Court Hours - Conferences & Meetings	meeting with client: reviewed client's documents and file (1.8)	1.8	50	90
10/6/2021	Out of Court Hours - Hearing Preparation	trial prep - review petition and develop strategy (.6)	0	50	0
10/8/2021	Out of Court Hours - Other	Court wait time (1.5)	1.5	50	75
10/19/2021	Out of Court Hours - CFTM, Foster Care Review Board	CFTM (1.2)	1.2	50	60
10/27/2021	Out of Court Hours - CFTM, Foster Care Review Board	CFTM (1.1)	1.1	50	55
11/4/2021	Out of Court Hours - Correspondence	emails with court clerk x2	0.1	50	5
11/5/2021	Out of Court Hours - Correspondence	5 emails with parties	0.3	50	15
11/16/2021	Out of Court Hours - Research & Review	received (.1) and reviewed documents/safety plan/reports (.5)	0.6	50	30
11/17/2021	Out of Court Hours - CFTM, Foster Care Review Board	CFTM 1.6	1.5	50	75
1/2/2022	Out of Court Hours - Research & Review	research case law (.7); trial prep - review file (.6)	0.5	50	25
1/4/2022	Out of Court Hours - Other	court wait time (2)	1	50	50
1/4/2022	Out of Court Hours - Travel Time	Office [REDACTED] to [REDACTED] and back to office [REDACTED]	0.6	50	30
1/9/2022	Out of Court Hours - Hearing Preparation	Complete file review (1)	1	50	50
1/10/2022	Out of Court Hours - Other	court wait time (2)	1	50	50
2/7/2022	Out of Court Hours - Correspondence	emails with parties x3	0.2	50	10
2/15/2022	Out of Court Hours - Correspondence	9 emails with parties (.8); reviewed hair follicles (2)	0.3	50	15
2/23/2022	Out of Court Hours - Correspondence	email with parties x6	0.3	50	15

**Claim Total** [REDACTED]